RESOLUTION 2019-34

PURCHASE OF EQUIPMENT FOR CITY OF MARIETTA

WHEREAS, the purchase of equipment, materials and supplies is necessary to perform

the duties relative to the functions lawfully imposed upon or assumed by the City of Marietta;

WHEREAS, the following equipment is needed to allow for the performance of the above
described duties/functions: AUTOMATIC GATE OPENERS AT PRAIRIEVIEW
CEMETERY AND LAKEVIEW CEMETERY;

WHEREAS, in accordance with Section 2-172 of the Code of Ordinances, the following
competitive bids for the purchase were submitted:

BUILT-RITE (VIA TOP QUALITY) AUTOMATIC GATE OPENERS $10,666
LL FENCE & OUTDOOR DES. NO BID NO BID
KEVIN KING WELDING NO BID NO BID

WHEREAS, staff recommend the purchase of equipment as submitted by BUILT-RITE
FENCE (TOP QUALITY), based upon the following justification: FAIR PRICE AND ONLY
BID SUBMITTED PER SPECIFICATIONS;

WHEREAS, funding is available to provide for this expenditure within the budget of the
current fiscal year, under the following department/account: 01-00-107- CEMETERY CARE
FUND:;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Marietta:
1. The purchase of AUTOMATIC GATE OPENERS as submitted by BUILT-RITE FENCE
(VIA TOP QUALITY) is hereby approved and authorized based on the recommendation of

staff as previously indicated.

2. The expenditure for the purchase will be deducted from the following department/account:
01-00-107- CEMETERY CARE FUND.
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PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL and SIGNED BY THE MAYOR this 8" day of
October. 2019.

CITY OF MARIETTA

o AL e

KERMYT MCKINNEY
ACTING MAYOR/COUNCIL PRESIDENT
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425 Fighiand Parway 10P QUALITY ESTIMATE

Norman, OK 73069

405-579-3667

ESTIMATE #: 2837
OK Lic # AC440673 D 0 0 R S DATE: 10/03/2019
BILL TO: JOB SITE ADDRESS:
Built-Rite Fence BUILT-RITE FENCE
1014 E. Highway 82 #114 MARIETTA, OK 73448

Gainesville, TX 76240-2721

DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE EACH TOTAL

All—O-Matic Toro24 Swing Actuator Gate Operator 3 1,334.00 4,002.00T
i:le-gflbjatic Toro24 Swing Actuator Arm 3 667.00 2,001.00T
40" Slave Cable for All-O-Matic Toro24 Swing Actuator Gate 3 67.00 201.00T
Operator

LiftMaster Universal Receiver 3 84.00 252.00T
LiftMaster 893 Remote 6 35.00 210.00T
Enforcer Polarized Reflective Safety Eye Set 3 250.00 750.00T
Labor for Installation of Gate Operator 3 1,000.00 3,600.00
Trip Charge to Marietta 1 250.00 250.00
* Electric must be provided by customer at the location of the gate 1 0.00 0.00

operator prior to scheduled installation date.

SUBTOTAL 10,666.00
SALES TAX 0.00
TOTAL DUE $10,666.00

All Estimates are valid for 45 days from date of estimate. After 45 days, please contact Top Quality Doors, LLC for an
updated estimate.

Make all checks payable to Top Quality Doors, LLC

All balances past said term will be subject to finance charges of 1.25% (15% annually)

Warranty for Installation: 1 year on parts and labor

Warranty for service: 90 days on parts

Any repairs performed during the warranty period by any person other than a representative of Top Quality Doors will
void any warranty.

Damage caused by weather, acts of God, nature, human error, vandalism, or other emergency will not be covered by
warranty.

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!




